City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 6, 2006
PROJECT: Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Simplot Partners
1720 Pleasant Street
Noblesville, IN 46060
(800) 966-1987

UAP Prof. Products
7123 Thorndale Lane
Cincinnati, OH 45244

(513) 673-9114

Turfgrass Inc.
8045 D Dixie Hwy.
Florence, KY 41042

(800) 474-9710

ProSource One
3811 Wead Place
Bellbrook, OH 45305
(937) 603-8414

Lesco, Inc.

1301 East 9th Street
Cleveland, OH 44144
(800) 321-5325

Southwest Landmark
818 South US 42
Lebanon, OH 45036
(513) 932-2015

Progressive Turf
P.O. Box 4280
Canton, GA 30114
(513) 652-5027

Item Description Estimated | Unit of Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost
Quantity | Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade: 24-4-12,
1]/60% Nutralene, Fairway Grade (50 150 Bags No Bid $ - $ 1875 | $ 2812501 $ 18112 | $ 2,718.00 | $ 1895 | $ 2842501 $ 1950 | $ 2,925.00 ] $ 2045 | $ 3,067.50 n
Ibs/bag) =
- >
-0- 0,
[22:0-22, 00% Muralene, Fainway 80 Bags |$ 2700|$ 216000| NoBid |$ - s 2170 [$  1,736.00 | $ 2218 |$ 177440 | $ 2050 [ $  1,640.00 | $ 2366 |$  1,892.80 S
rade (50 lbs/bag) =
Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 20-0-20 . “<f
3 100% Nutralene, Greens Grade 60 Bags No Bid $ - $ 23453 1,407.00 | $ 36.70 | $ 2,202.00] $ 24751 $ 1,485.00 | $ 2595 | $ 1,557.00| $ 2565 | $ 1,539.00 =
(&)
4(10-3-5 Liquied Fertilizer (2X2.5/CS) 15 Cases | $ 70.00 | $ 280.00 1% 33.15($ 497.25 No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 47.00 | $ 705.00 No Bid $ - E
<
5|25-3-3 with Trimec (50 Ibs/bag) 65 Bags | $ 1250 | $ 81250 | $ 1407 | $ 914.55 No Bid $ - $ 1400 | $ 910.00| $ 1532 1% 995.80 | $10.27 /90 bags| $ 924.30 °
2.3 Wi 0 2
6 (15802Ib?;/Vt\>/;;h) TEAM (1.155%) 32 WIN| - g Bags NoBid |$ - 1s 1393|s 766153 1760 |$  968.00]s 1560 | 706003 120 |s 714453 1272|$  699.60 3
Fertilizer: 18-5-9, Guaranteed . é‘
7 Analysis (50 Ibs/bag) 750 Bags No Bid 3$ - $ 1229 | $ 9,21750 ] $ 1695 |$ 12,71250] 3% 960 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 1690 |$ 12,675.00] % 7671 $ 5,752.50 =
Fertilizer: 18-24-12, Country Club . 3
8 Starter (50 Ibs/bag) 90 Bags No Bid $ - $ 11.89 1,070.10 | $ 1460 | $ 1,314.00 | $ 11.53 1,037.70 | $ 11.55 1,03950 | $ 9.79 881.10 ]
9|Wetting Agents: Conduit 90 160 Gal $ 200 / case 6,400.00 | $ 55.20 8,832.00 | $ 38.75 | $ 6,200.00 | $ 46.00 7,360.00 | $ 18.90 3,024.00 | $ 37.50 6,000.00 g
Fungicides: Aliette Signature WDG o
10|(Ethyl Hydrogen Phophonate, 4 Cases | $ 399.00 | $ 1,596.00 | $ 42460 | $ 1,698.40 | $ 409.00 | $ 1,636.00 | $ 434.00 | $ 1,736.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 1,500.00 No Bid $ - £
Fosetylal (2-11 Ib bags/case) 3
Daconil ZN Chlorothalonil 54% S
11 Flowable (2-2.5 Gal/Case) 37 Cases | $ 23040 [ $ 8,524.80 | $ 12230 | $ 4,525.10 | $ 230.04 | $ 8,511.48 ] $ 23040 $ 8,524.80 | $ 150.00 | $ 5,550.00 $35.95/¢al | $ 6,650.75 -5
12|Banol (Propamacarb) (2-1 Gal/Case) 15 Cases | $ 630.00 | $ 9,450.00 | $ 669.00 [ $ 10,035.00]1 % 629.70 | $ 9,44550 | $ 598.00 | $ 8,970.00 | $ 685.00 | $ 10,275.00 No Bid $ - m
[¢6]
13|Emerald (3 X .49 Ibs./bag) 2 Cases | $ 452,76 | $ 905.52 | $150.92/bag | $ 905.52 | $ 565.95 | $ 1,131.90 | $ 1,886.50 | $ 3,773.00 | $ 15092 | $ 905.52 No Bid 3 - §
' o
14 éi?‘jgf;rys Flowable (2x 2.5 20 | cases |$  72500|$ 1450000|$  630.00|$ 1260000|$ 69500 |$ 1390000|$ 66150 |$ 1323000|$  657.00|$ 11.826.00| $11850/gal [$ 11,850.00 £
. (@]
Chipco 26GT Flowable 23.3% . LCJ
15 (Iprodione) (4-1 Gal./Case) 40 Cases | $ 510.00 [$ 20,400.00 | $ 43250 | $ 13,840.00] $ 49575 |$ 19,830.00 | $ 495.00 | $ 19,800.00 | $ 349.00 [ $ 11,168.00 No Bid $ - =
16|Banner Mazz (2X1 Gal/Case) 15 Cases | $ 578.00 | $ 8,670.00 | $ 450.00 [ $ 6,750.00 | $ 587.00 | $ 8,805.00 | $ 566.44 | $ 8,496.60 | $ 385.00 | $ 5,775.00 $210.00/gal | $ 6,300.00 $ -
17|Heritage (6 Ibs/case) 2 Cases | $ 2,050.50 | $ 4,101.001 % 2,050.50 | $ 4,101.001 % 2,050.50 | $ 4,101.001 % 2,050.50 | $ 4,101.001 % 914.01 | $ 1,828.02 No Bid $ - $ -
Pre & Post Emergent Weed Control:
18|Betasan 12.5G (Bensulide) (50 10 Bags No Bid $ - $ 132.00 | $ 1,320.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 700.00 No Bid $ - No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ -
Ibs/bag)
Trimec Classic (2,4-D+NCPP
19 +Dicamba) (2 X 2.5 Gals/Case) 8 Cases | $ 110.00 | $ 880.00 | $ 87501 % 700.001 $ 12700 | $ 1,016.00 | $ 129.20 | $ 1,033.60 | $ 9750 | $ 780.00 $18.98/¢gal | $ 759.20 $ -
20[Round-up Pro (2 - 2.5 Gal/Case) 20 Gal $ 120.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 26.50 | $ 530.00 | $ 4275 | $ 855.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 840.00 | $ 33.34 [ $ 666.80 | $ 3083 [ $ 616.60 3 -
21|Kog Weed Control (35.5 Ibs/bag) 10 Bags No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 37.00 | $ 370.00 No Bid $ - No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ -
22|0Oryzalin 4 Pro (2 - 2.5 Gal/Case) 50 Gal 3 390.00 | $ 3,900.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 72251 % 3,612.50 No Bid $ - $ 67.80 | $ 3,390.00 No Bid $ - $ -
23|Insecticides: Scimitar 16 Qts. $ 117.00 | $ 1,872.00 | $ 107.00 | $ 1,712.00 | $ 114.00 | $ 1,824.00 | $ 107.24 | $ 1,715.84 | $ 17490 | $ 349.79 No Bid $ - $ -
24|Mach 11 (2 - 2.5 Gal/Case) 35 Gal $ 525.00 | $ 3,675.00 | $ 96.50 | $ 3,377.50 | $ 102.00 | $ 3,5670.00 | $ 94.00 | $ 3,290.00 | $ 99.80 [ $ 3,493.00 | $ 98.18 | $ 3,436.30 3 -
25|Preen 2,200 Ibs $88.25/hag | $ 3,883.00 | $ 120 $ 2,640.00 | $ 1581|$ 3,476.00 | $ 0.68 | $ 1,496.00 | $ 058 | $ 1,276.00 $2250/bag | $ 1,237.50 $ -
26|Grass Seed: Rye (CPR) (50 Ibs/bag) 1500 Ibs $ 49.00 | $ 1,470.00 | $ 089 1]% 1,335.00 | $ 090 | % 1,350.00 | $ 079 1% 1,185.00 | $ 079 1% 1,185.00 | $ 0895 | $ 1,342.50 $ -
27 Eer::l:‘e/Eg;aejéﬁi’ 1555 2000 | Ibs NoBid |$ - s 1020 [$  2,040.00 | $ 090 |$ 180000] NoBid |3 - s 079 |$ 1580008 0975 [$  1,950.00 $ :
28|Grass Seed: KY 31 1000 Ibs No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 0931]% 930.00 No Bid $ - $ 076 | $ 760.00 | $ 094 1% 940.00 $ -
Blue Grass
29 Award/Impact/Midnight 1000 Ibs $ 120.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 1990 | $ 1,990.00 | $ 198 | $ 1,980.00 | $ 189 | $ 1,890.00 | $ 1641$ 1,640.00 | $ 22851 $ 2,285.00 $ -
3o[fihee (Fs'g'fb‘;‘/”fag)'aygm“”d Seed | o450 lbs | $7250/bag|$ 355250 | s 1210 |$ 296450 | s 090|$ 220500 131|$ 320050 $ 1048  254800]$ 0915 |$  2.241.75 $ -
Recede Liquid Antifoam (12 .
33 X 16 Oz. Bottles/CS) 3 Cases | $ 58.00 | $ 17400 | $ 154.800 | $ 23220| $ 48.00 | $ 144.00 $1490/Qt. | $ 268.20 | $ 74.00 | $ 222.00 No Bid $ - $ -
Total $ 102,006.32 $ 103,213.27 $ 119,043.30 $ 106,120.54 $ 91,947.58 $ 60,366.40




