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City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 18, 2014
PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost
 Quantity Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total

1 Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:              
100% Meth Urea (50 lbs/bag) 85 Bags  No Bid -$                 $            24.25 2,061.25$        $            24.95 2,120.75$        $            37.00 3,145.00$        $            25.50 2,167.50$       

2 Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:                 
60% Meth Urea (50 lbs/bag) 80 Bags  No Bid -$                 $            25.25 2,020.00$        $            19.95 1,596.00$        $            26.25 2,100.00$        $            24.00 1,920.00$       

3 Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                           
17-3-17 93% NS-54 (50 lbs/bag) 22 Bags  No Bid -$                 $            22.50 495.00$           $            24.25 533.50$           $            34.00 748.00$           No Bid -$                

4 Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                 
25-50% Slow Release (50 lbs/bag) 30 Bags  No Bid -$                24.75$            742.50$          33.15$            994.50$          33.00$            990.00$          26.50$            795.00$          

5
Fertilizer - Rough Grade:                  
22-0-16 .125 Dimension,1% 
Ronstar(50 lbs/bag)

45 Bags  No Bid -$                17.30$            778.50$          54.55$            2,454.75$       No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

6
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                
65% MU w/Micros                          18-
6-15 (50 lbs/bag)

50 Bags 34.50$            1,725.00$       39.00$            1,950.00$       34.45$            1,722.50$       34.00$            1,700.00$       29.00$            1,450.00$       

7
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                     
90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe 
Micros 13-2-13 (50 lbs/bag)

30 Bags 32.50$            975.00$          18.75$            562.50$          28.20$            846.00$          No Bid -$                20.50$            615.00$          

8
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                       
18% MU w/Micros                             
19-26-5 (50 lbs/bag)

15 Bags No Bid -$                23.06$            345.90$          29.75$            446.25$          No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

9
Fertilizer - Rough Grade:                                                      
5-0-10 .125 Dimension (50 lbs/bag) 45 Bags 20.49$            922.05$          15.17$            682.65$          15.95$            717.75$          14.99$            674.55$          21.00$            945.00$          

10
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                           
50% MU/UF                                          
25-5-15 (50 lbs/bag)

15 Bags No Bid -$                24.00$            360.00$          32.60$            489.00$          35.00$            525.00$          24.00$            360.00$          

11 Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                             
50% SCU 25-0-3 (50 lbs/bag) 16 Bags No Bid -$                24.00$            384.00$          No Bid -$                14.99$            239.84$          No Bid -$                

12 Fertilizer - (Sprayable) 18-3-4                         25 Gal No Bid -$                11.60$            290.00$          34.30$            857.50$          12.80$            320.00$          10.75$            268.75$          

13 Fertilizer - Roough Grade:                          
50% SCU  25-5-12 (50 lbs/bag) 100 Bags No Bid -$                15.00$            1,500.00$       12.19$            1,219.00$       19.00$            1,900.00$       16.50$            1,650.00$       

14 Fortify 6-0-0 (2X 2.5 Gal./Case) 10 Gal 25.00$            250.00$          7.81$              78.08$            46.00$            460.00$          No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

15 Kphite Systemic Fungicide 
(Phosphorous Acid) 55% 100 Gal 51.00$            5,100.00$       48.00$            4,800.00$       21.50$            2,150.00$       28.00$            2,800.00$       40.00$            4,000.00$       

16
Solitaire Hebicide 
(Sulfentrazone/Quinclorac)                                           
(2 x 2.5 Gal./Case)

10.0 Gal $125/lb 125.00$          125/lb 1,250.00$       382.50$          382.50$          No Bid -$                $97.50/lb 388.80$          

17 Chlorothalonil                                  (2 
X 2.5 Gal/Case) 5 Cases 255.00$          1,275.00$       124.50$          622.50$          123.00$          615.00$          180.00$          900.00$          125.00$          625.00$          

18 Instrata                                               
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 12.5 Gal 158.00$          1,975.00$       158.00$          1,975.00$       No Bid -$                158.00$          1,975.00$       158.00$          1,975.00$       

19 Concert                                              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 147.5 Gal 68.40$            10,089.00$     68.40$            10,089.00$     No Bid -$                68.40$            10,089.00$     68.40$            10,089.00$     

20 Secure                                               (2 
X 2.5 Gal/Case) 17.5 Gal 540.00$          9,450.00$       540.00$          9,450.00$       No Bid -$                540.00$          9,450.00$       540.00$          9,450.00$       

21 Medallion                                                         
(2 x 16 x 5) Case 8 Gal 540.00$          4,320.00$       540.00$          4,320.00$       No Bid -$                540.00$          4,320.00$       540.00$          4,320.00$       

22 Heritage WDG (1 LB) 9 Lbs  $          317.00 2,853.00$        $          317.00 2,853.00$        No Bid -$                 $          317.00 2,853.00$        $          317.00 2,853.00$       

Harrell's 
720 Kraft Rod

Lakeland, FL 33815
800-282-8007

Bellbrook, OH 45305

John Deere Landscapes
1385 East 36th Street

216-706-9250
Cleveland, OH 44114

The Hill Co.
2776 Circleport Drive
Erlanger, KY 41018

859-815-8320

Helena Chemical Co.
902 Greengate Dr.

Lebannon, OH 45036
513-314-1591

Green Velvet Sod Farms
3620 Upper Bellbrook Road
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Harrell's 
720 Kraft Rod

Lakeland, FL 33815
800-282-8007

Bellbrook, OH 45305

John Deere Landscapes
1385 East 36th Street

216-706-9250
Cleveland, OH 44114

The Hill Co.
2776 Circleport Drive
Erlanger, KY 41018

859-815-8320

Helena Chemical Co.
902 Greengate Dr.

Lebannon, OH 45036
513-314-1591

Green Velvet Sod Farms
3620 Upper Bellbrook Road

23 Propaconizole                                               
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 4 Cases 275.00$          1,100.00$       $250/4 gal. 1,250.00$       315.75$          1,263.00$       $79/gal 1,580.00$       60.00$            1,200.00$       

24 T-Meth Thiophanate                                              
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 5 Cases 398.00$          1,990.00$       284.00$          1,420.00$       315.75$          1,578.75$       $57.60/gal 1,440.00$       245.00$          1,225.00$       

25 Banner Max II                                             
(2 x 1 Gal/Case) 16 Gal $214/gal 3,344.00$       $206/10 gal. 3,344.00$       No Bid -$                214.00$          3,424.00$       206/10 gal. 3,344.00$       

26 Megalex 3-0-0                                      
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 15 Cases No Bid -$                No Bid -$                225.00$          3,375.00$       $40/gal 3,000.00$       No Bid -$                

27 Heritage FP (6 LB)                                              30 Lbs $1902/6 lb 9,510.00$       317.00$          9,510.00$       No Bid -$                $1,902/6 lb 9,510.00$       317.00$          9,510.00$       

28 3Way Weed Spray                                                   
(2 x 2.5 gal/case) 10 Cases 138.00$          1,380.00$       112.00$          1,120.00$       129.05$          1,290.50$       140.00$          1,400.00$       112.50$          1,125.00$       

29 Proxy                                                     
(2 x 2.5 gal/case) 1 Case 240.00$          240.00$          190.00$          190.00$          160.00$          160.00$          85.00$            85.00$            130.00$          130.00$          

30 Round Up (2 x 2.5gal/case) 10 Cases 89.00$            890.00$          94.00$            940.00$          83.00$            830.00$          99.00$            990.00$          80.00$            800.00$          
31 Bensumec (2 x 1gal/case) 2.5 Cases 600.00$          1,500.00$       $120/gal 600.00$          No Bid -$                $120/gal 600.00$          525.00$          1,312.50$       
32 Dac Action (2 x 2.5gal/case) 50 Gal 90.00$            4,500.00$       72.00$            3,600.00$       No Bid -$                72.00$            3,600.00$       72.00$            3,600.00$       
33 TGR Paclobutrazol 5 Gal 398.00$          1,990.00$       203.00$          1,015.00$       223.00$          1,115.00$       100.00$          500.00$          180.00$          900.00$          
34 Accelypryn 2 Gal 1,820.00$       3,640.00$       1,820.00$       3,640.00$       No Bid -$                $910/.5 gal 3,640.00$       1,820.00$       3,640.00$       
35 Primo Maxx (1 gal) 3 Gal 283.00$          849.00$          283.00$          849.00$          No Bid -$                283.00$          849.00$          283.00$          849.00$          
36 Ferromec AC (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 10 Cases 69.00$            690.00$          35.00$            350.00$          61.10$            611.00$          50.00$            500.00$          32.25$            322.50$          
37 Cytozorb-S  (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 7 Cases 227.50$          1,592.50$       540/5 gal. 3,780.00$       227.50$          1,592.50$       200.00$          1,400.00$       No Bid -$                
38 Nitroplast-S (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 4 Cases 176.00$          704.00$          104.00$          416.00$          176.00$          704.00$          No Bid -$                125.00$          500.00$          
39 PTO (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 15 Gal 36.50$            547.50$          13.20$            198.00$          182.5/case 547.50$          No Bid -$                44.00$            660.00$          
40 Mojave Imazypyr (2 x 5lb/case) 50 Lbs No Bid -$                9.00$              450.00$          12.25$            612.50$          No Bid -$                10.50$            525.00$          
41 Penncross Bent Seed 125 Lbs 8.95$              1,118.75$       7.00$              875.00$          7.70$              962.50$          6.99$              873.75$          7.75$              968.75$          
42 Conduit Wetting Agent 8 Gal 64.80$            518.40$          No Bid -$                30.95$            247.60$          39.00$            312.00$          37.00$            296.00$          
43 OARS Wetting Agent 16 Gal 83.60$            1,337.60$       No Bid -$                58.95$            943.20$          80.00$            1,280.00$       50.00$            800.00$          

44 Primera - One Apex 10                          
(2 x 2.5gal/case) 10 Gal No Bid -$                No Bid -$                72.00$            720.00$          No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

45 Turf Type Tall Fescue Blend                       
(50 lbs/bag) 1500 Lbs 1.40$              2,100.00$       1.28$              1,920.00$       1.27$              1,905.00$       1.29$              1,935.00$       No Bid -$                

46 Snapshot Pre M (50 lbs/bag) 55 Bags 90.00$            4,950.00$       69.00$            3,795.00$       76.50$            4,207.50$       89.00$            4,895.00$       60.00$            3,300.00$       
Total 83,550.80$     87,247.02$     40,270.55$     86,543.14$     78,879.80$     

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation will be made to Council.
There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded to the lowest bidder.
Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and the lowest.
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1 Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:              
100% Meth Urea (50 lbs/bag) 85 Bags

2 Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:                 
60% Meth Urea (50 lbs/bag) 80 Bags

3 Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                           
17-3-17 93% NS-54 (50 lbs/bag) 22 Bags

4 Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                 
25-50% Slow Release (50 lbs/bag) 30 Bags

5
Fertilizer - Rough Grade:                  
22-0-16 .125 Dimension,1% 
Ronstar(50 lbs/bag)

45 Bags

6
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                
65% MU w/Micros                          18-
6-15 (50 lbs/bag)

50 Bags

7
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                     
90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe 
Micros 13-2-13 (50 lbs/bag)

30 Bags

8
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                       
18% MU w/Micros                             
19-26-5 (50 lbs/bag)

15 Bags

9
Fertilizer - Rough Grade:                                                      
5-0-10 .125 Dimension (50 lbs/bag) 45 Bags

10
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                           
50% MU/UF                                          
25-5-15 (50 lbs/bag)

15 Bags

11 Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                             
50% SCU 25-0-3 (50 lbs/bag) 16 Bags

12 Fertilizer - (Sprayable) 18-3-4                         25 Gal

13 Fertilizer - Roough Grade:                          
50% SCU  25-5-12 (50 lbs/bag) 100 Bags

14 Fortify 6-0-0 (2X 2.5 Gal./Case) 10 Gal

15 Kphite Systemic Fungicide 
(Phosphorous Acid) 55% 100 Gal

16
Solitaire Hebicide 
(Sulfentrazone/Quinclorac)                                           
(2 x 2.5 Gal./Case)

10.0 Gal

17 Chlorothalonil                                  (2 
X 2.5 Gal/Case) 5 Cases

18 Instrata                                               
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 12.5 Gal

19 Concert                                              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 147.5 Gal

20 Secure                                               (2 
X 2.5 Gal/Case) 17.5 Gal

21 Medallion                                                         
(2 x 16 x 5) Case 8 Gal

22 Heritage WDG (1 LB) 9 Lbs

Unit Cost Item  Cost
Total Total

 $            34.00 2,890.00$       

 $            29.00 2,320.00$       

 $            24.65 542.30$          

30.00$            900.00$          

55.00$            2,475.00$       

29.85$            1,492.50$       

No Bid -$                

31.00$            465.00$          

18.65$            839.25$          

24.65$            369.75$          

15.50$            248.00$          

15.40$            385.00$          

15.00$            1,500.00$       

48.00$            480.00$          

24.00$            2,400.00$       

99.00$            990.00$          

128.50$          642.50$          

158.00$          1,975.00$       

76.00$            11,210.00$     

540.00$          9,450.00$       

540.00$          4,320.00$       

 $          317.00 2,853.00$       

Residex-Turfgrass
5865 Highland Ridge Dr.
Cincinnati, OH  45232

859-512-4838
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Item Description Estimated Unit of 
 Quantity Measure

                 
    

23 Propaconizole                                               
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 4 Cases

24 T-Meth Thiophanate                                              
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 5 Cases

25 Banner Max II                                             
(2 x 1 Gal/Case) 16 Gal

26 Megalex 3-0-0                                      
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 15 Cases

27 Heritage FP (6 LB)                                              30 Lbs

28 3Way Weed Spray                                                   
(2 x 2.5 gal/case) 10 Cases

29 Proxy                                                     
(2 x 2.5 gal/case) 1 Case

30 Round Up (2 x 2.5gal/case) 10 Cases
31 Bensumec (2 x 1gal/case) 2.5 Cases
32 Dac Action (2 x 2.5gal/case) 50 Gal
33 TGR Paclobutrazol 5 Gal
34 Accelypryn 2 Gal
35 Primo Maxx (1 gal) 3 Gal
36 Ferromec AC (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 10 Cases
37 Cytozorb-S  (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 7 Cases
38 Nitroplast-S (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 4 Cases
39 PTO (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 15 Gal
40 Mojave Imazypyr (2 x 5lb/case) 50 Lbs
41 Penncross Bent Seed 125 Lbs
42 Conduit Wetting Agent 8 Gal
43 OARS Wetting Agent 16 Gal

44 Primera - One Apex 10                          
(2 x 2.5gal/case) 10 Gal

45 Turf Type Tall Fescue Blend                       
(50 lbs/bag) 1500 Lbs

46 Snapshot Pre M (50 lbs/bag) 55 Bags
Total

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Departm         
There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded to the lo  
Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and  

Unit Cost Item  Cost
Total Total

Residex-Turfgrass
5865 Highland Ridge Dr.
Cincinnati, OH  45232

859-512-4838

310.00$          1,240.00$       

272.50$          1,362.50$       

428.00$          6,848.00$       

180.00$          2,700.00$       

$1,902/6 lb 57,060.00$     

112.65$          1,126.50$       

158.00$          158.00$          

94.00$            940.00$          
220.00$          550.00$          

72.00$            3,600.00$       
195.00$          975.00$          

$910/1/2 gal 3,640.00$       
130.00$          390.00$          

65.00$            650.00$          
180.00$          1,260.00$       

77.00$            308.00$          
31.00$            465.00$          

No Bid -$                
7.75$              968.75$          

43.00$            344.00$          
54.00$            864.00$          

22.00$            220.00$          

1.15$              1,725.00$       

85.00$            4,675.00$       
140,826.05$   
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