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City of Fairfield, Ohio 
Bid Opening - Results 

 
 
Project(s): Waterworks Park/Nuxhall Pavilion 
Project Estimate:  $462,121.00  
Date:   July 7, 2008  (City of Fairfield, Council Chambers) 
 

Contractor 
(Address & Phone) 

Bid #1 
General 
Trades 

 

Bid #2 
Plumbing 

 

Bid #3 
HVAC 

 

Bid #4 
Electrical 

Bid #5 
Combined 

Bid 

Bid 
Security 

Addendum 
#1 Received

Non-Collusion 
& PP Tax 
Affidavits 

Atkins & Stang, Inc 
1031 Meta Drive 
Cincinnati, OH 45237 
513-242-8300 
 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 

 
No Bid 

 
$51,300.00 

 
No Bid 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

No 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 
Amerilect Inc 
3987 Ham-Middletown 
Hamilton, OH  45011 
513-737-3900 
 

 
No Bid 

 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$75,000.00 

 
No Bid 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

Yes 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 
Langenheim & 
Thomson 
4817 Glenshade Ave 
Cincinnati, OH  45227 
513-272-0022 
 

 
$716,796.00 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

No 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 

Queen City Mechanicals 
1950 Waycross Road 
Cincinnati, OH  45240 
513-353-1430 
 

 
No Bid 

 
$34,400.00 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

Yes 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 
Progressive Plumbing 
531 Hanover Street 
Hamilton, OH  45012 
513-863-1711 

 
No Bid 

 
$35,600.00 

 

 
$14,500.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$48,000.00  
Plumbing 

and HVAC 
 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

Yes 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 
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City of Fairfield, Ohio 
Bid Opening - Results 

 
Project(s): Waterworks Park/Nuxhall Pavilion 
Project Estimate:  $462,121.00  
Date:   July 7, 2008  (City of Fairfield, Council Chambers) 
 

Contractor 
(Address & Phone) 

Bid #1 
General 
Trades 

 

Bid #2 
Plumbing 

 

Bid #3 
HVAC 

 

Bid #4 
Electrical 

Bid #5 
Combined 

Bid 

Bid 
Security 

Addendum 
#1 Received

Non-Collusion 
& PP Tax 
Affidavits 

R E Schweitzer Const 
2563 W. North Bend 
Cincinnati, OH 45239 
513-542-4950 
 

 
$708,753.00 
 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

No 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 
Carrera Construction 
2409 Spring Grove   
Cincinnati,  OH  45214 
513-929-9800 
 

 
$670,200.00 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

Yes 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 
Comprehensive Facility 
Services 
1718 Ralston Ave 
Cincinnati, OH 45223 
513-761-5131 
 

 
$681,320.00 

 
$36,210.00 

 
No Bid 

 
$41,800.00 

 
$759,330.00 

General, 
Plumbing & 

Electrical 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

Yes 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 

Century Construction 
34 Kenton Lands Rd 
P O Box 18670 
Erlanger, Ky 41018 
859-331-6629 
 

 
$732,000.00 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

No 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 

PerformanceConst. 
201 Sunset Ave 
North Bend, OH 45052 
513-598-5100 

 
$707,800.00 
 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

Yes 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 
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City of Fairfield, Ohio 
Bid Opening - Results 

 
 
Project(s): Waterworks Park/Nuxhall Pavilion 
Project Estimate:  $462,121.00  
Date:   July 7, 2008  (City of Fairfield, Council Chambers) 
 

Contractor 
(Address & Phone) 

Bid #1 
General 
Trades 

 

Bid #2 
Plumbing 

 

Bid #3 
HVAC 

 

Bid #4 
Electrical 

Bid #5 
Combined 

Bid 

Bid 
Security 

Addendum 
#1 Received

Non-Collusion 
& PP Tax 
Affidavits 

RLE Construction 
4050 Executive Park Dr 
Suite 230 
Cincinnati, OH 45241 
513-563-9333 
 

 
$714,400.00 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

Yes 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 

B & J Electrical Co 
6316 Wiehe Road 
Cincinnati, OH 45237 
513-351-7100 
 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$42,800.00 

 
No Bid 

 
Yes  

(Bond) 

 
Yes 

Yes 
Non-Collusion 

Yes 
PP Tax 

Affidavit 
 

 
**  These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation will be made to Council.  There is no guarantee 
that the contract will be awarded to the lowest bidder.  Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and the lowest bid. 
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