
Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation
will be made to Council.  There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded
to the lowest bidder.  Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best
and the lowest bidder.

$680,000.00

HVAC
Electric

General
Plumbing

$53,500.00

Electric
$755,000.00

No Bid No Bid

ITEM # 5  COMBINED BID ON THE FOLLOWING DIVISION OF THE WORK

City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulations for: Waterworks Park / Nuxhall Pavilion
Bid Opening:  September 22, 2007
Engineer's Estimate:  $592,500.00

CBS Construction
1018 Woodrow Street
Cincinnati, OH 45204

513-471-8888

Butler County ElectricApplied Contracting C orp.
6573 Tulip Lane #101 1 Millikin Street

Liberty Twp., OH 45044
513-777-0758

Hamilton, OH 45013

ITEM # 1  GENERAL TRADES CONTRACT

513-892-6800

No Bid No Bid

ITEM # 2  PLUMBING CONTRACT

ITEM # 3  HEATING, VENTILATING & AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC)

ITEM # 4  ELECTRICAL CONTRACT

$508,000.00 $379,922.00

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$36,922.00

CFS
1718 Ralston Avenue
Cincinnati, OH 45223

513-761-5131

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$640,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

General
Plumbing

HVAC
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Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation
will be made to Council.  There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded
to the lowest bidder.  Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best
and the lowest bidder.

ITEM # 5  COMBINED BID ON THE FOLLOWING DIVISION OF THE WORK

City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulations for: Waterworks Park / Nuxhall Pavilion
Bid Opening:  September 22, 2007
Engineer's Estimate:  $592,500.00

ITEM # 1  GENERAL TRADES CONTRACT

ITEM # 2  PLUMBING CONTRACT

ITEM # 3  HEATING, VENTILATING & AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC)

ITEM # 4  ELECTRICAL CONTRACT

Electric
$719,370.00

Plumbing
HVAC

General

$50,000.00

$50,000.00

513-528-2633

510 Batavia Pike
Jindal Builders

Cincinnati, OH 45244

$623,870.00

$50,000.00

$640,533.00

General
Plumbing

HVAC
Electric

General
Plumbing

HVAC
-

$634,000.00

No Bid

Kramer & Feldman Inc.
7636 Production Drive
Cincinnati, OH 45237

513-821-7444

No Bid

$514,658.00

No Bid

No Bid

$592,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Century Construction
34 Kenton Lands Rd.
Erlanger, KY 41018

859-331-6626

CR& R Inc.
4525 Este Avenue

Cincinnati, OH 45232
513-542-8822

$577,000.00

$100,000.00

$50,000.00

No Bid
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Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation
will be made to Council.  There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded
to the lowest bidder.  Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best
and the lowest bidder.

ITEM # 5  COMBINED BID ON THE FOLLOWING DIVISION OF THE WORK

City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulations for: Waterworks Park / Nuxhall Pavilion
Bid Opening:  September 22, 2007
Engineer's Estimate:  $592,500.00

ITEM # 1  GENERAL TRADES CONTRACT

ITEM # 2  PLUMBING CONTRACT

ITEM # 3  HEATING, VENTILATING & AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC)

ITEM # 4  ELECTRICAL CONTRACT

No BidNo Bid

$549,800.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Performance Const.
201 Sunset Avenue

North Bend, OH 45052
513-598-5100

Mark Spaulding Const.
5785 Constitution Deive

Florence, KY 41042
859-746-8403

$580,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Mardis and Meehan Const.
337 Pike Street

Covington, KY 41011
859-291-7422

$569,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

RLE Construction Inc.
4050 Executive Park Dr.

Cincinnati, OH 45241
513-563-9333

$570,500.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation
will be made to Council.  There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded
to the lowest bidder.  Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best
and the lowest bidder.

ITEM # 5  COMBINED BID ON THE FOLLOWING DIVISION OF THE WORK

City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulations for: Waterworks Park / Nuxhall Pavilion
Bid Opening:  September 22, 2007
Engineer's Estimate:  $592,500.00

ITEM # 1  GENERAL TRADES CONTRACT

ITEM # 2  PLUMBING CONTRACT

ITEM # 3  HEATING, VENTILATING & AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC)

ITEM # 4  ELECTRICAL CONTRACT

No BidNo Bid

No BidNo Bid

No BidNo Bid

No BidNo Bid

$34,900.00$86,600.00

Cincinnati, OH 45247Cincinnati, OH 45247
513-616-3944513-741-4887

JMW PlumbingCampbell's Ready to Go
8714 Forfeit Run Rd.8216 Springfield Lake

No BidNo Bid

No BidNo Bid

Valor Construction Co.
1128 Ohio Pike

Amelia, OH 45102
513-474-3472

$597,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

Traid Construction
507 South College Ave.

Oxford, OH 45056
513-523-5647

$505,415.00

No Bid

No Bid
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Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

Total Labor and Material

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation
will be made to Council.  There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded
to the lowest bidder.  Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best
and the lowest bidder.

ITEM # 5  COMBINED BID ON THE FOLLOWING DIVISION OF THE WORK

City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulations for: Waterworks Park / Nuxhall Pavilion
Bid Opening:  September 22, 2007
Engineer's Estimate:  $592,500.00

ITEM # 1  GENERAL TRADES CONTRACT

ITEM # 2  PLUMBING CONTRACT

ITEM # 3  HEATING, VENTILATING & AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC)

ITEM # 4  ELECTRICAL CONTRACT

-
$55,800.00

-
Plumbing

HVAC
-

$59,850.00

Progressive Plumbing Co.
531 Hanover Street

Hamilton, OH 45012
513-863-1711

No Bid

$43,800.00

$14,000.00

No Bid

-
Plumbing

HVAC

Queen City Mechanicals
1950 Waycross Road
Cincinnati, OH 45240

513-353-1430

No Bid

$42,000.00

$22,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

B & J Electrical Co.
6316 Wiehe Road

Cincinnati, OH 45237
513-351-7100

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$53,500.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$52,200.00

Atkins & Stang Inc.
1031 Meta Drive

Cincinnati, OH 45237
513-242-8300
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